


Citty off Samita 1fe, New Mlexico

memo

December 18, 2013

TO: Finance Committee

FROM: Robert Rodarte, Officer M
Purchasing Division P

VIA: Marcos A. Tapia, DirM

Finance Department "

ISSUE: Award of Bid # 14/100/B
Fire Department Uniforms

SUMMARY:

On December 5, 2013, a total of three bids were received for the procurement of the above referenced
service. The three vendors Capitol City Uniforms (Santa Fe), Roadrunner Printers (Santa Fe) and Neves
Uniforms {Albuquerque), all met the requirements as stated in the bid documentation and were deemed
responsive.

The Purchasing Division i3 requesting a muitiple awards of this bid and recognizes all three vendors as
qualified participants.

Award format:

The attached Bid Tabulations Sheet identifies all items that will be awarded to each vendor. The first seven
items of the bid tabulation sheet will not be awarded at this time. These seven items will be renegotiated
with the vendors after a better product description is supplied by the Fire Department. The three vendors
will only be allowed to provide the Fire Department with the items identified on the Bid tabulation.
Example, all three vendors identified several items as “NO BID”, and no substitutions will be allowed.

All items on this competitive Bid were brand specific and meet all the uniform requirements currently in
place at the Fire Department.

Funding for this procurement is available in City of Santa Fe Business Unit 22105.510300 (Fire Property
Tax/Uniforms). The Fire Department has an annual budget of $103,718 and currently has an available
amount of $49,528.76, for year ending 6/30/2014.

ACTION REQUESTED:

It is requested that this recommendation of award to Capitol City Uniforms, Roadrunner Printers and Neves
Uniforms, be reviewed, approved and submitted to the City Council for its consideration.

S5001.PM5 - 7/85



Citty off Sante 1fe,New Mexico

memo

December 10, 2013

TO: Finance Committee Members
City Council Members

FROM: Jan M. Snyder, Assistance Fire Chief Q’S

VIA: Erik Litzenberg, Fire Chief £~
Robert Rodarte, Purchasing Director mw

SUBJECT: Fire Department Uniform Bid Award (Bid #14-21B)

The City of Santa Fe Fire Department recently went out to bid for its station uniform package.
These items include: hats, shirts, jackets, pants, boots etc. worn by department personnel on a
daily basis.

Capital City Uniform, Neves and Roadrunner Screen printers were awarded the bid. We would
like approval to spend over $50,000.00 to any one of the awarded vendors if that threshold shall

occur,

Funds for these purchases will conie from the department’s Fire Property Tax business unit
22251.530500 (Uniform, Clothing, Lines).

Please find attached an abridged version of each contract that was submitted.

Attachments (3)
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"Clsss A Cover - Hat Badge Chief $15.00 No Bid $1 14.00-T
"Class A Cover - Hat Badge Captains $15.00 No Bid $114.00
"Clsss A Cover - Hat Badge LT $15.00 No Bid $92.50
"Class A Cover - Hat Badge Firefighter $15.00 No Bid $92.30
[[c1ass A Captains Badge $30,00 No Bid $62.60
"Class A Captains Silver Strap No Bid No Bid $10.95
"CIass A Lieutenant's Badge $30.00 No Bid $62.00
"Class A Retired Cover Red TCC Cord No Bid No Bid $8.‘50
"Ball Cap w/SFFD Maltese $22.00 $17.00 $14.95
"Knit Watch Cap W/SFFD Maltese $15.50 $8.75 $9:50
"Fleece Watch Cap w/SFFD Maltese $15.50 $8.85 31495
"Class A Chief Officer Jacket $150.00 No Bid $141:00
"Class A Jacket $150.00 No Bid $141:00
"Class A Jacket Sleeve Silver or Gold $18.00 No Bid $6.00
“Class A Jacket #A2971, #A4280 $22.00 No Bid $1¥50
"Class A Jacket #A2875, #A2876 $22.50 No Bid $11.50
”Winter Jacket Mens 48073-724 No Bid No Bid $2472.50
"Winter Jacket Womens 38074-724 No Bid Discontinued Discontihued
IILite Jacket 48038 No Bid $127.60 $95.50
"Chiei"s Lite Jacket 48099 No Bid No Bid $105.50
ISweatshirt 4525M $36.50 $32.25 $28.50
Job Shirt 4630X $85.00 No Bid 36950
|Officer’s Shirt Long Sieeve 35W5400 $39.50 No Bid $41.95
"Oﬂ'lcer‘s Shirt Short Sleeve 85R5400 $38.50 No Bid $36.95
uClass A Shirt Long Sleeve 15W5425 $38.50 No Bid $35.l95
uClass B Shirt Long Sleeve SH95 $68.65 $86.50 $89.50
"Class B Shirt Short Sleeve SH96 $90.00 $76.95 $83.50
"Class C T Shirt Long Sleeve Beefy -T $19.75 $17.75 $17.95
"Class C T Shirt Short Sleeve Beefy-T $16.75 $15.50 $13.76
"Polo Shirt Short Sleeve Men 71182 $44.00 $44.75 $39.00
lIPoto Shirt Long Steeve Men 72360 $46.00 $49.75 $48.50]




[lpoto shirt women's 61164 $35.50 $42.75 $39.00
HClass A & B Insignia A2908, A2906 $19.50 No Bid $13.95
nClass A & B Insignia A2909, A2909-2 $32.50 No Bid $13.95
flchiefs Badge B1009 $65.00 No Bid $62.00
(lCaptain LT Badge B1009 $54.00 No Bid $62.00
"Badge FF Eng Rescue Para B1009 $54.00 No Bid $62.00
[IBadge Retired B1009 $95.00 No Bid $62.00
[lsFFD Pateh $3.50 No Bid $125
{ISFFD Retired Patch $4.00 No Bid $125
[lsFFD EMT-P Patch $4.00 No Bid $1.25
(ISEFD EMT-1 Patch $4.00 No Bid $1.25
[lsFED EMT-B Paten $4.00 No Bid $1.25
flciass A Pant 38840 $42.00 No Bid $41.95
flc1ass B/C Pant PA08-7905 $95.00 $79.50 $95.95
[lciass B/C Pant PA65-7905 $125.00 $116.50 $116.95
‘ Boot HoneyWell 3003 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boot HoneyWell 5006 No Bid No Bid No Bid
{iBoot Thorogood 804-6446 $200.00 $185.00 $155.00
[Boot Thorogood 804-6032 $160.00 $127.00 $105.00
”Boot Red Wing 4473 No Bid $205.95 No Bid
[IBoot Red Wing 4471 No Bid $249.00 $192.00
[1Boot Danner 42082 No Bid $215.00 $192.00
IBoot 5.11 12026 No Bid $140.00 $142,50
Hﬁoot Globe Shadow No Bid No Bid No Bid
{lc1ass A Shoe Men Rocky 510-8 $70.00 $75.00 $57.50
"Class A Shoe Women Rocky 210-8 $70.00 $75.00 $57.50
[IClass A Shoe Men Bates 22141 $65.00 No Bid $59.50
[lc1ass A Shoe Women Bates 22741 $65.00 No Bid $59.50
(IBett Dutyman 1511 or 1611 $20.00 No Bid $15.95
lIBett 5.11 59405-019 No Bid $35.75 $37.00
flctass A Tie Men $6.00 No Bid $3.95
[Class A Tie Women $5.00 No Bid $4.50
Tie Clip $5.00 No Bid $2.75
Name Plate $9.50 $6.95
X X




CITY OF SANTA FE

BID/PROPOSAL RECEIVED IN THE PURCHASING OFFICE LISTING
2651 Siringo Road, or P.O. Box 909, Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504-0909
Robert Rodarte, Purchasing Officer

DATE TIME 14/21/B COMPANY NAME SIGN-IN

12/05/13 10:28 Capitol City Uniforms SR

531 W. Cordova Road

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505

12/05/13 11:23 Roadrunner Screen Printers GV

1235 Siler Road #C

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87507

12/05/13 1:32 Neves Uniforms GV

2538 Camino Entrada #200

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87507




LOCAL PREFERENCE CERTIFICATION FORM

RFP/RFB NO: '14/21/B

Business Name: Roadrunner Screen Printers

Principal Ofﬁce: 1235 S”er Rd # C Santa Fe NM 87507
Street Address City State Zip Code

City of Santa Fe Business License #_13-00104249 (Attach Copy to this Form)

Date Principal Office was established: 02/11/2011 (Established date
must be six months before date of Publication of this RFP or RFB).

CERTIFICATION

| hereby certify that the business set out above is the principal Offeror submitting
this offer or is one of the principal Offerors jointly submitting this offer (e.g. as a
partnership, joint venture). 1 hereby certify that the information which | have
provided on this Form is true and correct, that | am authorized to sign on behaif
of the business set out above and, if requested by the City of Santa Fe, will
provide within 3 working days of receipt of notice, the necessary documents to
substantiate the information provided on this Form.

Signature of Authorized Individual:

Printed Name: Sherrie Berry

Title: Owner Date: __/ «2/5//3
7
Subscribed and sworn before me by Noroud T &QS this fjl(‘: day of
Locornirn n QOVD

My commission expires 08 -02-20\™>

% My Commlssion Exptres

L KT 5 S




City of Santa Fe Fire Department Uniforms Specifications Brand or Equal:

ftem Make Mode! Style - Brand - or Equal Color Price
Class-A Cover - Chiefs Midway Bell Crown -114 Gold strap #GNL40 with Gold Blackinton hat badge #A2860, #A4278, or #A2862 White
Class-A Cover - Captains Midway Bell Crown -114 Silver Strap #SNL40 with Silver Blackinton hat badge #A2866 Navy Blue
Class-A Cover- LT Midway Bell Crown -114 Black Strap with Silver Blackinton hat badge #A2867 Navy Biue
Class-A Cover - Firefighter Midway Bell Crown -114 Black Strap with Silver Blackinton hat badge #A8175 Navy Blue
Class-A Cover Accassories Blackinton A2866 Captain's Class-A Cover badge only Silver
Class-A Cover Accessories Midway SNL4O Captain’s Class-A Cover Silver Strap only Silver
Class-A Cover Accessories Blackinton A2867 Lieutenant's Class-A Cover badge only Sitver
Class-A Cover Accessories Midway TCC Retired Class-A Cover Red TCC Cord only Red
Ball Cap Richardson 185 With SFFD Maltese Cross embreidered in color on front and "SANTA FE FIRE" in white on back Navy Blue 17.00
Knit Watch Cap With "SFFO", in white, embreidered on the front Navy Blue 8.75
Fleece Watch Cap Yupoong 2006 With "SFFD", in white, embroidered on the front Navy Blue 8.85
Class-AJacket - Chief Officer Flechheimer-Flying Cross 38804 11.50z 100% Poly Double Breasted with 6 Gold "FD" Buttens and SFFD patch on both shoulders Navy Blue
Class-A Jacket Flechheimer-Flying Cross 38804 11.50z 100% Poly Double Breasted with 6 Silver "FD" Buttons and SFFD paich on both shoulders Nawy Biue
Class-A Jacket Accessories Class-A Jacket steeve strip(s} - Silver or Gold - Each Pair Sitver/Gold
Class-A Jacket Accessories Blackinton Varlous Class-A Jacket 15/16 inch round collar insignia - #A297 1, #A4280, #A2574 - Pair Gold
Class-A Jacket Accessories Blackinton Various Class-A Jacket 15716 inch round coflar insignia - #A2875 and #A2876 - Pair Silver
Winter Jacket - Mens 5.11 48073-724 Hi-Vis Winter Jacket - Shell wf "SFFD” only heat pressed in reflective silver on back Flo/Navy 260.50
and full color SFFD Maltese Cross embroidery on front along with Velcro strip for name tape
Fleece wiull color SFFD Maltese Cross embroidery on front along with Velcro strip for name tape
and SFED only heat pressed in reflective silver on back
Winter Jacket - Womens 5.11 38074-724 Hi-Vis Winter Jacket - Shell w/ "SFFD" only heat pressed in reflective silver on hack FlofNawy Pl e ]

and full color SFFD Maltese Cross embroidery on front along with Velcro strip for name tape
Fleece wifull color SFFD Maltese Cross embroidery on front along with Velcro strip for name tape

and SFFD only heat pressed in reflective silver on back

OS¢
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Lite Jacket 5.11 48038 Tactical Flegce w/ "SFFD" only heat pressed in reflective silver on back Navy Biue 127.60
and fult color SFFD Maltese Gross embroidery on front alang with Velcro strip for name tape
Chiel's Lite Jacket 5.1 43099 Chameleon Softshell w/*SFFD" only heat pressed in reflective sifver on back Navy Blue
and full color SFFD Maltese Crass embroidery on front along with Velcro strip for name tape
Sweatshirt Jerzees 4525M Super Sweats Nublend 8.5 oz 50% Cotton 50% Poly w/ silk screening of full color SFFD Maltese Cross Navy Blue 32,05
on front and "SFFD” Est. 1880 design on back, Firstinitial, Last Name and Rank embroidered on front
Job Shirt Blauer 4B30X Blauer Job Shirt 80% Cotton 20 % Poly w/ silk screening of full color SFFD Maltese Cross Navy Blue
on front and "SFFD" Est, 1880 design on back, First Initial, Last Name and Rank embroidered on front
Qfficer's Shirt - Long Sleeve Fiying Cross 35W5400 4.250z Duro Poplin 65% Dacron Poly 35% Cotton Blend-Long Slesve w/SFFD palch on left shoulder White
and EMT patch on right shoulder
Officer's Shirt - Short Sleeve Flying Cross 85R5400 4.250z Duro Poplin 85% Dacron Poly 35% Cotton Blend-Short Sleeve w/SFFD patch on left shoulder White
and EMT patch on right shoulder
Class-A Shirt - Long Sleeve Flying Cross 15W5425 4.250z Duro Poplin 65% Dacron Poly 35% Cotton Blend-Short Sleeve wiSFFD patch on left shoulder only Med, Biue
Class-B Shirt - Long Sleeve Topps SHE5 5.50z 55% FFR/M5% Cotton - Long Sleeve w/ SFFD patch on left shoulder and EMT patch on right Med, Blue 86.50
Class-B Shirt - Short Sleeve Topps SH98 5.50z 55% FFR/45% Cotlon - Shert Sleeve w/ SFFD patch on left shoulder and EMT patch on right Med. Blue 76.85
Class-C T Shirt - Long Slesve Hanes Beefy-T 100% Cotton 8.10z - Long Sleeve w/ silk screening of full color SFFD Maltese Cross on front Navy Blue 17.75
and "SFFD" Est, 1880 design on back. First Initial, Last Name and Rank embroidered on front
Class-C T Shint - Short Sleeve Hanes Beefy-T 100% Cotton 8,10z - Short Sleeve w/ sitk screening of full color SFFD Maltese Cross on front Navy Biue 15.50
and "SFFD" Est. 1880 design on back. First Initial, Last Name and Rank embroidered on front

Polo Shirts - Short Sleeve - Men 51 71182 100% Cotton 6 oz - Tactical Polo Short Sleeve w/ mic clips at shoulders and pen pockets Navy Blue 4475

and full color SFFD Maltese Cross embroidery on front along with First Initial, Last Name and Rank
Polo Shirts - Long Sleeve - Men 5,11 72360 100% 6 oz - Tactical Pole - Long Sleeve w/ mic clips at shoulders and pen pockets Mavy Blue 49.75

and full color SFFD Maltese Cross embroidery on front along with First Initial, Last Name and Rank
Polo Shirts - Women's 5.11 61164 100% 8 oz - Tactical Polo - Short Sleeve w/ mic clips at shoulders and pen pockets Navy Blue 4275

and fult color SFFD Maltese Cross embroidery on front along with First Initial, Last Name and Rank
fCFassA & B Shirt Insignia Blackinton Various Class-A & B Cut-out collar insignia - #AZ808, #A2808, #42905 - Pair Gold




Class A & B -Shirt Insignia Blackinton Various Class-A & B Cut-out collar insignia - #2290 § #A2508-2 - Pair Silver

Badge - Chisfs Blackinton B100% Wilh either A8963, ABISS, ABS73 or ABS77 center in blue enamel - Blue lettering Gold

Badge - Captand LT Blackinton 81009 With either A6381 or AB985 center in blua enamel - Blue lettering Silver

Badge - FF, Eng, Rescue, Para Blackinton B1009 With A2886 center in silver - Blue lettering Silver

Badge - Retlired Blackinton 81009 With A8427 center in red enamel - Silver Badge with Gold Panels - Red Leftering Gold&Sitver

SFFD Patch See altched Image

SFFD Retired Patch See attched Image

SFFD EMT-P Patch See attiched Image

SFFD EMT- Patch See atiched Image

SFFD EMT- B Patch See atiched Image

Class-A Pant Flechheimer-Flying Cross 38840 100% Poly Navy Blue

Class-B/C Pant Firewear PA0B-7905 9.50z 55% FFR/45% Cotton Bend Navy Blue 79.50
Class-B/C Pant Firewear PABS-7905 9,50z 55% FFR/45% Cotton Biend - EMT Style Navy Blue 116.50
Boots HoneyWell/ProWarrington 3003 Leather - Zipper front Black

Boots HoneyWell/ProWarrington 5008 14 inch Pull-on Bunker Boot Black

Boots Thorogood 804-6446 Front Zipper Leather - 8 inch Black 185.00
Boots Thorogood 804-6032 Pull-on Side Zipperleather - 8 inch Black 127 00
Boots Red Wing 4473 Leather - Lace-up/zipper Black 20595
Bools Red Wing 4471 Leather - Pull-On Black 248.00
Boots Danner 42982 Striker il GTX - Side Zipper Black 215.00
Boots 511 12026 ATAC - Leather - 8 inch Black 140.00
Boots Globe Shadow 14 inch Puil-on Bunker Boot Black

Class-A Shoe - Men Rocky 510-8 HiGloss - Men's Black 75.00
Class-A Shoe - Women Rocky 210-8 HiGloss - Women's Black 75.00
Class-A Shoe - Men Bates 22141 HiGluss - Men's Black

Class-A Shoe - Women Bates 22741 HiGloss - Women's Black

Belt Dutyman 1611 or 1611 Plain w/ Gold or Silver buckle Black

Belt 5.11 59405-018 Operator Tactical Belt Black 85,75
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Belt Blackhawk CBQ Tactical Belt Black
Class A Tie - Mens Clip-on Dark Navy
Class A Tie - Womens Cross-over style Dark Navy
Tie Clip Bar Tie Clip - Plain Gold/Silver
First Initial and Last Name Gold/Silver 9.50

Name Plate

11



City Of Santa Fe
PO BOX 909
Santa Fe NM, 87504

City of Santa Fe, New Mexico
BUSINESS LICENSE

Official Document
Please Post

Business Name: ROADRUNNER SCREEN PRINTERS
Location: 1235 SILER RD

Class: BUSINESS REGISTRATION - STANDARD

Comment: WHOLESALE SCREENPRINTING

ROADRUNNER SCREEN PRINTERS
1235 SILERRD C

SANTA FE NM 87507

Control Number: 0058977

License Number: 13-00104249
Issue Date March 11,2013

Expiration Date December 31,2013

THIS IS NOT A CONSTRUCTION PERMIT OR SIGN PERMIT. APPROPRIATE

PERMITS MUST BE OBTAINED FROM THE CITY OF SANTA FE BUILDING PERMIT
DIVISION PRIOR TO COMMENCEMENT OF ANY CONSTRUCTION OR THE INSTALLATION
OF ANY EXTERIOR SIGN.

THIS REGISTRATION/LICENSE IS NOT TRANSFERABLE TO OTHER BUSINESSES OR PREMISES.

e




The City may extend the purchase of goods under this Bid at the option of the City for a period of
four (4) years from the date of the executed purchase order, subject to the agreement of the
offeror.

The City reserves the right to alter quantities based on availability of budget. If this will alter the
bid amount, the bidder must note the percent increase for lesser quantities.

BIDDER'S:
FQL)\)Q \‘\D\ Q\Jrg Uin LQOY"W\ S
irm

531 0, Cordava 2d

Address

Authorized Signature

!
Pennie,  Ouimnos

Print Name

Cuwone 0
Position ~ ‘

(Sos)-QRY- 3734, (508) 8483-378Q
Phone Number Fax Number

e, B 4013
DATE

N.M. RESIDENT PREFERENCE NUMBER (if applicable): | < () [ (<

TWO COMPLETE COPIES OF THE BID SUBMITTAL IS REQUIRED

15
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CITY OF SANTA FE
FIRE DEPARTMENT

“REQUEST FOR BID”
FIRE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS

BID # ‘14/21/B

BID DUE:

December 5, 2013

2:00 P.M.

PURCHASING OFFICE

CITY OF SANTA FE

2651 SIRINGO ROAD - BUILDING “H”
‘SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87505

14



City of Santa Fe Fire Department Uniforms Specifications Brand or Equal:

ltem Make Model Style - Brand - or Equal Color Price
Class-A Cover - Chiafs Midway Bell Crown 114 Gold strep #GNLAD with Gold Blackinton hat badge FAZE60, #A4ZTS, or #2662 Witte /& 000 |
Class-A Cover - Captalng Midway Bell Crown 114 Sitver Strap #SNLAO with Siiver Blackinton hat badge #4286 Nawy Blue H#5 oy >
Class-A Cover - LT Micway Boll Crown 114 Black Strap with Sitver Blackinton et badge #AZ867 Nawy Blue 96755 O £
Clase-A Cover - Firefighter Midway Bell Crown -114 Black Strap with Siiver Blackinton hat badge $A9175 NEwBlue 8 /Q{ O
Class-A Cover Accessories Blackinten A2866 Captain's Claas-A Covar badge only Siver KleRele
Class-A Cover Accessarias Midway SNLAD Captain's Class-A Caver Siiver Strap only Siiver
Class-A Cover Actossories Blackinton AZ887 Usutanant’s Class-A Cover bsdgs only Silver g 2 o
Class-A Cover Accessorles Midway TCC Retirod Class-A Cover Red TCC Cord only Red  {A/n 2,0y
Balf Cap Richardsor 185 With SFFD Malteas Cross embroldered In color on front and "SANTA FE FIRE" in white on back. Navy Blue @(Q 2. 00
Krlt Watch Cap With "SEED”, in white, embroidared o the front Navy Blie 67 <7 50
Fleecs Watch Cap Yupoang 2008 With "SFFD", in whits; embrokderad on the front NevyBlue 57 S
Class-A Jacket - Chief Officer Flochhelmer-Flving Cross 38804 11,502 100% Poly Double Breasted with 8 Gokd "FU” Buttons eand SFFD pateh on both shoulders Navy Blus
Class-A Jacket Flschheimer-Flying Cross 38804 11,50z 100% Poly Double Brassted with 6 Siiver "FD* Buttens.and SFFD patoh on both shoulders NavyBlue T |50, 54
Class-A Jacket Accessories ‘ClassA Jackel slaave stip(s) - Siiver or Gold - Each Palr StvesiGold 45 19,5
Class-A Jackel Accessories Blackinton Vatious Class-A Jackel 15716 inch round collar insignia » #A2971, #A4280, #A2874 - Palr Gold gg& Role
Class-A Jacket Accessortes Bleckinton Varous _Class-A Jucket 16/16 inch round collar insignia - #A2875 ed #A2876 - Pair Sitver 23 .50
Winter Jacket - Mens 511 ABO73-724 Hi-Vis Winter Jacket - Shell w "SFFD" only heat pressed in reflactive silver on back Flo/Navy
and full coler SFFD Mlultese Cross embrokiery on front along with Velers. strip for name tape
Fleece wiull color SFED Mattase Cross embroldery on front afong with Velero strip for nams tape

and SFED only hoat pressed in reflactivs sitver on back Alp BID

Wintsr Jacket - Womens 511 38074724 Hi-Vis Winter Jacket - Shati W/ "SFFD" only héat prassed in reflective sfiver an beck FloiNavy
and full color SFFD Maltess Cross embroldery on front atong with Velcro stip for name tape
Flaece wifull color SFFD Maltesa Cross smbroldary on front slong with Velero sirip for name tape
and SEED oAty heat pressed n reflsctive sivar on back Mo RiD
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Lite Jackat 5.114 48038 Tammwﬁsswmmmmmm sitver on back Navy Blue
and ful color SFFD Maltess Cross embroldery an frant along vith Velero strip for name taps ALY D
Chief's Lita Jacket 5,11 48009 Chamatson Softshall W”SFFD” only heat pressed in reflective siiver on back Navy Blue
and flt color SFED Maltese Cross ambrotdery on front along vith Valoro atrlp for name taps L0 1D
Swaeatshirt Jerzees 45250 Super Sweats Nublend 8.5 oz 50% Cotton 50% Poly w siik screening of full color SFFD Maltese Cross Nawy Blue
on front and "SFED" Est. 1880 design on back, First Inifis], Last Nams and Rank embroidered on front %fé, 50
Job Shirt Blaver 4830% Blauer Job Shirt B0% Cetton 20 % Poly w silk screening of full eofor SFFD Maftese Cross Navy Blue [
on front and "SFFD” Est, 1880 design on back, First initial, Last Name and Rank embroldered on front $5.00
Officer’s Shirt - Long Sleeve Flying Cross 35W5400 4.250z Duro Poplin 85% Dacron Paly 35% Cotton Blend-Long Steeve WSFFD patch on Jeft shoukder Whits
Qnmac Sivel! and EMT patch on right shouldsr - © ‘ﬁB‘%, 5¢
Officer's Shirt - Short Slaove Fiing Cross 85R5400 4.250z Buro Poplin 5% Dacron Poly 35% Cotton Bland-Short Steeve WISFFD paich on laft shoulder White k
‘9:13{0@.(2 Seadl snd EMT patch on right shoulder 350
Class-A Shirt » Long Slesve Flying Cross 15W5425 4.250z Qurn Poplin 85% Dacron Poly 35% Cotton Blend-Short Sleave WSFFD patch on Isft shoulder only Med. Blue
:pmmﬂo tc)_{movi $3% s
Cfass-B8 Shirt - Long Slesve Topps SH5 5.502 55% FFR/45% Cotton ~ Long Sleeve wi SFFD pateh on left shoulder and EMT patch on right Med.Blue |3 b & &i
Class-8 Shirt - Short Sieeve Topps SHes §.50z 55% FFR/45% Cotton - Short Slaeve w SEFD patch on left shoulkder and EMT petch on dght Med.Blue P DA An
Class-C T Shirt - Long Sleave Hanes Beaty-T 100% Cotton 5,10z « Long Sleave wf sik screening of full cofor SFFD Maltese Cross on front Nawy Biue
and "SFFD" Est. 1880 design on back, First nitial, Last Name and Rank embroideredon front  * ’F q,75
Claes-C T Shirt - Short Stesve Hanes Beaty.T 100% Cotton B.102 ~ Short Slagve v/ sl scraening of fufl color SFFD Mattese Cross on front Navy Blue #
and "SFED” Est, 1880 design on back, First lnitis], Lest Name end Renk smbroldered on front [, 7 5
Polo Shirts - Short Sleeve - Men NE-XR 71182 100% Cotion 6 oz - Tactical Polo Short Slesva w mic clips at shoulders and pan pockets Navy Bive
Tru r::ﬁm'e.m :R‘-z’ff i Kll color SFFD Mattese Cross embroklery on front along with Fitst Initial, Last Name and Rank 46‘ o0
Polo Shirts - Long Sleeve - Men 5.41 72350 % 100% B oz - Tactical Polo - Long Sleeve wf mic ¢lips at shoulders and pen pockets Navy Blua
e W ‘{ 7 and full color SFFD Maftess Cross smbroldery on front along with First initial, Last Name and Renk ‘f(o 0O
Folo Shirts - Women's 511 84164 100% & oz ~ Tactical Pola « Short Sleeve w/ mic clips at shoulders and pen pockets Navy Blue |
*fr’-u gn%,&cgqlq and full color SFFD Maltesa Cross ambroldery on front stong with First Inftial, Last Narme and Rank 3550
i M
|class A& B Shirtinsignia | Blackinton 1 Varous Class-A & B Cut-out collar Inslgnia - #A2008, £A2808, ¥AZ805 - Palr | cd #/9.52 1|
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Blackinton

Varous

Class A & B -Shit Insigria Class-A & B Cistout coftar insignia - #42900 & #A2009-2 - Pair Siver . B30, = &
Badge - Chisfs Blackinton 21009 With sithar ABOSS, ABOSD, ABST3 or ASSTT cofiter In biue erstnel - Blus lettering: Gold . ¢
Badge - Captand LT Blsckinton B1009 Wity alther ABSEY or AGSSS cartar in bluo ensimel < Blus lattering. Sitver. - ,
{Badge - FF, Eng, Rescue, Para Blackinton B1009  With A2886 center in siver - Blue lettering- v | sver £ QO]
Badge - Retired Blackinton B1009 With AB427 center in red enamel - Siiver Badge with Gold Panets - Red Lettering Gotdssiver = Q.57 0T |
{SFFD Patch Ses attched mage H#2 50
SFFD Ratired Patch Ses atictiedimage Bd.on
SEFD EMT-P Patch Ses atichad Image Hooo
SFFD EMT- Patch Sea attched Image g L}, 00
SFFD EMT-B Patch See atiched image el e
Ciass-A Pant FlechhaimerFlying Cross 36840 100% Poly Navy Blue NG, O
Class-/C Pant Firewear - PAQS-7905 9,502 5% FFR/A5% Cotton Bend NawBlue RO @0 O
Cless-BIC Pant Firewear PAGS-7905 9,502 65% FFR/46% Cotton Blend - EMT Style NevyBlue 19500 |
Boots HoneyWellProWamngton 3003 Leather ~ Zipper front Black
Boots HoneyWellProWarrington 5008 14 inch Pull-on Bunker Boot Black
Boots Thorogeod 804-6446 From Zipper Leathar Binch Black g Hon. 00
Hoots Thotogood 804-6032 Puflon Side. Zipperteather - 8.inch Black B 1248 so
Soots Red Wing 4473 Leather » Lacs-up/zipper Black
JBoots Red-Wing 4471 Leathar - PLlOn . Black
{Boots Danner 42982 Striker 1 GTX - Skde Zipper Black
{Boots .41 12028 ATAG - Loather - 8 Inch Black
Baots Globe Shataw 14 inch Pull-ori Bunker Boot Black
P
Class-A Shoe - Men ~'Racky £10.8 HiGloas - Men's sleck KN 00
Class-A Shoe - Women Rocky - 2108 HiGloss - Women's Black 10, 00
Class-A Shoe - Men Bates 22141 HiGoss - Mer's ek #5000
Class-A Shoe - Wemen Bates 22741 HiGloss - Women's Back  #)5. 00
Balt Dutyman 1511 or 1611 Plain w! Gold ot Silver buckle Black RN, oo
laen 5.41 59405018 Operator Tactical Belt Blask

-
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Bett Blackhawk cBQ Tactical Belt Black
Class A Tle - Mens Clip-on. Dark Navy

Class A Tie - Womens Cross-over slyla Dark Nawy - ¥

Tle Clip Bar Tle Clip - Plaln Gold/Siver 1 ¥, &

Go!dlSllver‘L Ul R

Name Plste

First Inftiel and Last Name

18



LOCAL PREFERENCE CERTIFICATION FORM

REPIRFB NO: ¥ M{/ 21 / A

Business Name: Q a0 lm ;‘?u Q,V\ Qz‘)t"m S

principal Office: __ 531 > Qordi 0d S&w}a& NM _g9505
B - Street Address’ Cuty State “Zip Code

City of Santa Fe Business License # Bc )R (Attach Copy to this Form)

Date Prlncipat Office was established: Mpu. 199767 (Established date
‘must be six months before date of Publication of this RFP or RFB).

CERTIFICAT[ON

,ereby certify that the husiness set o] “t above is the principal Offeror submittmg
this offer or Is one of the principal Offerors jointly submitting this offer (e.g. as a
int venture). | hereby certify that the information which 1 have
Form is true,and ‘correct, that | am authorized to sign on behalf

: - and, if requested by the: City of Santa Fe, will
, -receipt of notice, the necessary documents to
substantnate the information provi ed on this Form.

sigha‘tar_e;'omnthmized Individual: ¢ o cor—pfdime
Printed Name: ?e,m\\eg \D\MQS -

Title: C‘ﬁ?.\m 1\,4«'4/\ o ‘ Date‘ f’Z"’ / ’2-.“’ fg)

bscribed and swom before me by L2nn., Dhes  this S é?"‘gﬂ day of

' : ' T Daslm !&ontoya
YOU MUST RETURN THIS FORM WITH YO : amf o /NEWMEXK‘:O

19



RESIDENT VETERANS PREFERENCE CERT!F!CAT!ON

4 l?’lS(NAME OF CONTRAC’I’OR) hereby certifies the following in repard to
‘apphcanon of the es:dent véterans’ preference to this procurement.

' Plense check one box only:

DI declare under penalty of perjury that my business prior year revenue starting January 1 ending December 31 is
less than $1M all ywing me'the 10% preference discount on this solicitation, I understand that knowingly giving
false or misleading information about this fact constitutes a crime.

E] I declare under penalty of perjury that my business prior year revenue starting January 1 ending December 31 is
- more than $1M but less than $5M allowing me the 8% preference discouint on this solicitation, I understand that
knowingly giving false or misleading information about thls fact oonsututes a crime.

0 I declare under penalty of perjury that my- business prior yeat revenue startmg January 1 ending December 31is
more than $5M all¢ wing: me the 7% prefezeuce, iscount on this solicitation, I understand that knowingly giving
. falsé or mlslead ormiation about this fact constitutes a crime.

‘ submlt a report or reports to the State Purchasmg vais;on of the General Services Department
; declan z under penalty of perjury that during the last calendar year starting January 1 and ending on December 31,
the following to be true and accurate:

~In comuncnon thh thxs procurement and the requnements of this busmess apphcauon for a- Res ent

: BP \
“freport the award amount asa purchase ﬁom a pubhc hody orase pubhc works contract fmm a pubhc
_casemaybe. ... 2

: *~I¥ﬁhdér'stahdvﬁiéfkﬁowingly giving false or misleading 'infonnaﬁcn on this report constifutes a crime.

L declare under penalty of pegury that this statement is true to the best of my knowledge I understand that giving
faise or ﬁusleaﬁmg statements about material fact regarding this matter constitutes a crime.
' o [ ZomZem

(Date)

,&J‘i

*Must be an authonzed signatory of the Business.

The Iepresentatmn made by checking: ths abovc boxes constitutes a material representation by the business. If the
statements are proven to be incorrect, this may result in denial of an award or un-award of the procurement.

SIGNED AND SEALED Tms& mﬁ DAY OF @ﬁf’ opdooe 2018
Ao
J

N ?AR%UBLIC |
"OFFICIAL |

My Commisgion’ GAEY)  Desiree Montoya
’ ] NOTARY £44
‘ ? “TEQLM 6 } N it STATE O;mfn;i"g?(m

20



SPD725(7/83) CERTIFICATION NO.SPD _02R41

AFR 0 4 1998

DATE ISSUED

CAPITOL CITY UNIFORMS

IS HEREBY CERTIFIED BY i'HE OFFICE OF THE

State Purchasing Agent

TO BE A RESIDENT BIDDER AS DEFINED YN CHAPTER 13: PUBLIC PURCHASES
ACT 1982 CUMULATIVE SUPPLEMENT. AND PER RESIDENT BIDDER
CERTIFICATION QUESTIONNAIRE FILED IN THE STATE PURCHASING
DIVISION'S OFFICE.

21



City of Santa Fe, New Mexico
BUSINESS LICENSE

Sy

Official Document
PO BOX 909 o Please Post
Santa Fe NM, 87504

Business Name: CAPITOL CITY UNIFORMS
Location: 531 W CORDOVA RD

Class: BUSINESS REGISTRATION - STANDARD

Comment:

Control Number: 0000298

License Number: 13-00027378
Issue Date Aprif 17,2013

Expiration Date December 31,2013
CAPITOL CITY UNIFORMS

531 CORDOVA RD

SANTA FE NM 87501 THIS IS NOT A CONSTRUCTION PERMIT OR SIGN PERMIT. APPROPRIATE
PERMITS MUST BE OBTAINED FROM THE CITY OF SANTA FE BUILDING PERMIT
DIVISION PRIOR TO COMMENCEMENT OF ANY CONSTRUCTION OR THE INSTALLATION
OF ANY EXTERIOR SIGN.

THIS REGISTRATION/LICENSE IS NOT TRANSFERABLE TO OTHER BUSINESSES OR PREMISES.




| le/meszEis 13:17 spszeemaze NEWES UNIFORMS PAGE

The City may extend the purchase of goods under this Bid at the option of the City for a period of
four (4) years from the date of the executed purchase order, subject to the agreement of the
offeror.

The City reserves the right to alter quantities based on availability of budget. If this will alter the
bid amount, the bidder must note the percent increase for lesser quantities.

BIDDER'S:

}
Neves Uniforms © Eég)u.},o Mme.nt

Firm

A S2y O&H\U\D Erdcada S‘}"t‘;&a!)/} gaﬂdatlp N §7505

Vike, P uatens”

Authorized Signature

W\ "(a “DPLQQ e s

Print Name

)\Qﬂ‘\\ nx\cﬂ ﬂ\a,r\a a; o

Position

S05- N4 AR av Sos. A4 0197

Phone Number Fax Number

December ‘T &015

DATE

N.M. RESIDENT PREFERENCE NUMBER (if appticabte): L | | T4 19 L XD

TWO COMPLETE COPIES OF THE BID SUBMITTAL IS REQUIRED

15
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12/83/2013 13:17 5052658326 NEVES UNIFORMS F&GE  @7/31

CITY OF SANTA FE
BID FORM
-BID#“14121/8

EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATIONS

Bidder is required to return two (2) complete copies of these specifications, completely
furnishing all information requested. All requested information, data, literature, drawings, efc,
must be included with the hid submitted.

Bidder must check one of the following:

a. {\1 ) All specifications, terms and conditions are met,
b. ( ) Exceptions have been taken and noted on attached sheet (8).

All variations and/or exceptions to the specifications must be documented, referencing applicable
paragraph (s) and explained in detail. Attach as many pages as necessary. If no exceptions are
taken, it will be assumed that the bid meets all specifications and terms and conditions as stated
in this complete bid package. Failure to list exceptions may disqualify bid. Delivery of non-
conforming goods is at the expense of the bidder and/or other penaities.

All other specifications not detailed herein shall be as listed in the manufacturer's printed
literature for the current standard model. Manufacturer's printed literature and specifications
sheets shall be submitted with the bid.

Exceptions will not necessarily eliminate the bid. City staff shall determine acceptance or non-
acceptance of exceptions. Unless otherwise noted and approved, it is assumed that delivery of
the unit shall be as stated.

Signed submission of this bid represents that the bidder has accepted all terms, conditions and
requirements of the bid unless a written exception is made and, if awarded, the bid will represent
the agreement between the parties. Additionally, by signing this bid, the bidder warrants that
there was no collusion of any kind in submission of this bid.

DELIVERY

Bid:; shall include all costs of delivery to the City of Santa Fe, the specific location to be as
designated by City staff. Unit shall be completely operational and ready for use,

Date of delivery after notice o proceed: )
[ 3 b@pﬁr\dew}“ ON TY\G-J’\meac:;‘mrea rs
LR WD) caiendardays.:PpodMQT ova ilabi/ ""L‘*{ ,

Eidder ‘SHALL .!NCLUDE descriptive material such as plans, drawings, photographs, diagrams,
IHUS?&IﬂOﬂ?, written descriptions and manufacturer's literature with specifications with the bid.
Additional information or details may be required after the bid opening. Bids may be disqualified if

such information is not adequate to make a reasonably informed decision as to qualify, design,
capabilities, etc.

14
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LOCAL PREFERENGE CERTIFICATION FORM

RFP/RFE NO:

Business Name: < \ \
Principal Office: | \

Street Address City State Zip Code
City of 8anta Fe Business License # (Attach Copy to this Form)
Date Principal Office was established: (Established date

must be six months before date of Publication of this RFP or RFB).

CERTIFICATION

| hereby certify that the business set out above is the principal Offeror submitting
this offer or is one of the principal Offerors jointly submitting this offer (e.g. as a
partnership, joint venture). | hereby certify that the information which | have
provided on this Form is frue and correct, that | am authorized to sign on behalf
of the business set out above and, if requested by the City of Santa Fe, will
provide within 3 working days of receipt of notice, the necessary documents to
substantiate the information provided on this Form.

Signature of Authorized Individual;

Printed Name:
Title: , Date:
Subseribed and sworn before me by this , day of

My commission expires

Notary Public
SEAL

YOU MUST RETURN THIS FORM WITH YOU OFFER

TE/68 Fo9d ' SWADATNM S3ATN 92EB392565 LTET EIBZ/EB/Z1



PAGE  @1/01
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12/83/2813

NEVES UNIFORMS

City of Sants Fe Fire Department Uniforms Specificetions Brand or Equal:

flem take Kodel Shds - Brand - or Equsf Coloy Price
Class-A Cover - Chiels iy Saf Crawn 14 Bl srsp ESHLAD wilh Gald Blackinkan had badge #A06D, BALZTE, of SAZEE2 Whie i O
Clossi Cover - Capleing h¥idevay BeB Crowm 414 Shiver Skap BSHLAD with Sllvsr Blackihlon hal badpe #A2EEE - Weavy Biue % Ay Q_E_P
Cimssh Cover < LT WAy Hell Crown 114 Black Skeap wih Siiver Bleckinton hat badge £52867 Maw e | G391
Clase-A Cover - Flrefighter thdwmy Bell Crown 114 Bluck Strep with Siver Blackinion hat badgs SABITS Nawy Blue  [SX1), &
Dlass-A Gover Accessaries Blsckinion #2856 Caplakts Glass-A Cover badge oy Stver |t DO
Clags-4 Cover Acoessonies Hliway SNL40 Capiain's Closs-A Cover Sfvar Sirap oy Shver 10, 555 |
Class-A Cover Accesaodies Blackintan A2857 Lisulenante Class-H Cover badge oy Sier | (et s OO
Clasi-A Cover Actessndes sy TGE Retited Clags-A Covar fed TCC Cord only Red $.50
* e
Ball Cap Richsriisen 185 With BFFD Mallzss Cross smbolderet in color oa fronk end BANTA FE FIRE' In while on back NewBlus {5 8 &
$rll Watch Cep With "SFFD?, Frwhilfe, embroidered on s tron: Hoavy Bl i
|Feste Watch Cep Yemsong 2006 With "SFFD”, invehits, embiderad o the front $lavy Blue j_ 95 |
Cless-4 Jucket - Chiaf Offcer | FlechhslmerFling Grass 35304 11,50z 100% Poly Double Bressled wikh & Gofd "F0* Butions and SFFD patoh an bl shouldars Wy Boe | ICH, D
Class-A Jecke! Flechhetmen-Fiying Coss 3aap4 1t50z 100% Poly Doutds Bresshed véih 6 Slives “FO* Butions and SFFD patch on Both shoulders Hevy Bl }&@g . Of)
Class-A Jnckel Aocesseies Class-A Jacke! sieave sitp(s) - Bliver or Gok - Esch Palr ShverGaid | (i, 0T 2
Clase-R Jiiket Accessories . Blacknton Various Dlans-h Jacke! 1545 Inch covnd colar insignia - #A2671, #4426/, $A2874 - Palr Gok R~
Class-A Jacke! Accessories Blackéaton’ Various | Ciasa/ Jacke] $6016 inch round coliar insigria - SAZSTE end SAZATS ~ Pal S¥wer il 53}
Vinter Jrckef - Mens 551 4ABD73-724 Hi-Vis Winler Sackat - Shell we "SFFD” only best presssd in neftertive siver on back Floftdavy
R and fill calor BFFD Mallese Cross embraldary on from slong with Velers strip for same tape, 3%‘5{}
Fleecs waiulf color SFFE $AsBase Cross embraldery on front elang wifh Velom stip ke namz tape
N and SFFD only hiest pressed i eefiectve sifver an back
WWinter Jeskel - YWiomens 547 38074724 Hifis Winfer Jasket - Sheil wi "SFFD® oy hest pressed In reective sher onback

and fuk color SFFD {dslfese Cross embrokdery 31 front along vith Velka i lor nems 1ape
Fleese wiidl color SFFD Mallese Coss embrolderny on Fiont atong with Vakso stidp forname fepe
aixd SFFD anly hest pressen n refleciive sfver oa batk

Fhtawy
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Lita Jazkat ERE] 48039 TacBcat Faeca W 'SFFO” anly heal prassad In refactve sifvar on Dack Nayy Hlua 6,.. S’C‘
and full colar 8FFD Maltasa Crass smbroidary o frand alang wilh Vel atip for nams 1age cj ¢
Chisdy Lite Jasket 514 43098 Chamelson Softahell W SFED* anly heal prassad in reffective sdver o baek Nevy Blue f{,}éf‘%
snd 1l cofor SEFD Maltese Croas arbeoliery o fort along wéih Valem slrp (o4 nama taps
Saastshi Jarzzes AGIGH Supet Sweals NubRnd 9.5 oz EB% Ceiton 50% Faly af silk scraening of full codar SFFD Maltese Gross Rawy Blie % 5} )
Ed
an fiont and *SFFEX Eat. 1880 dasign an back, Flrat Irfiial, Lasl Noma snd Rank amtacddered on ond - .9’
Liob Salnt Bisuer 483X Stever Job Bhid 805 Colten 20 % Pahyw! 43 Yermsning of full color SFFD Mallsge Cross Nawy Bhue 1 q . 6?:3
endrord snd 'SFFOC Esl, 1880 deslgn on hack. Flstinital, Lasl Nama and Rank emdroldarad on front “‘?
Offears Shit- Long Slesvn Fiing Cross 35S0 4. 2500 Burg Popfin 35% Dagron Poly 35% Cotinn Sland-Lony Bleave wSFFD patch on Rk shauddes Viils ]}\} 0[5
and 14T paki on rdght shoukder '
Ctficars Shin « Short Slegva Fisng Cross BSRBALO 4,250z Dure Papin 65% Dacron Poly 18% (‘.’ul{m Rienct Bovod Sleave wSFFD palch an s ahaulder Whitle . 1@} ‘qg :
) and EMT gaich on right shauier : \% !
Class-X Shirt- Lorg Skeave Flyirg Crmas 55426 4.250z Eurn Paplln 65% Daooon Poly 35% Cotton Bleng-Shor Sleave wiSFFFgaich oo faft shoulder apdy Med, Blie ‘35' (fé’
- +
ClaseB Shint- Lanp Slesve Topps SHa3 8.502 55% FFRAMS% Cabion - Lang Staave v SEFD) patch on a8t shoulder ued ERT pateh an fight Mad.swe | BE S0
Clase-8 Shift « Short Slagve Torps EHBE 5.502 58% FFR/MB% Cottan - Shart Slaeve wi SFFD pateh on jaft shotdded and EMT patch an ight Ked. Rlua Z5, ‘ST:
Glazs-L T Shirt- Leng Sleave Hanes BeafyT 100%% Colton . 1oz - Long Slasve W slik geraenlng of Ldlwaker SFFD Malbse Croas on ont Mawy Blue "‘?5
and “SFFD* Es1. 1380 tasfgn ¢n back, Firsl In@lst, L3t Name and Rank esrbrniiered on frant m !
Class-C T §hil « Shert Slaaun Hapas BashT 1L0% Cotion 8,102 « Short Bleave v shk scaning of fuf color SFFD Mallase Crass on fonl Nawvy Blua -
and “SEFD” Est. #8390 dasign on back, Firstinlial, Last Nane snd Ruok embrokdered on front 13 ’
Prio Shixts » Short Sleeva - Man 511 71482 100% Collon B o2 - Tactcal Palu Shert Sfeave w! mio clips ot fhoulders and pen pedists Mavy Bl Of ‘D'U
and BN color SFED Meaitase Cross srabioifery un frcal alard with el Inillal, Last Name and Ruak g
Paie Stirla » Long Slezeva « Men 511 72380 1064 @ oz~ Taclieal Polo - Long Sleave w mic clipy a1 shoulders and pen pockets Nawvy Blus F
s sad fult coler SFFO Maltasa Grosa ambiraldsry on frort along with Fiest In¥al, Lsst Name apd Rank . ﬁ‘;%
Polo Shids - Warnen's 51 a1164 100% 8 o2 - Tactcal Fok « Sharl Slaave w mic clpe ot shotsders srd pon fockets Mavy Bhis al 6{}
and fif color SFFD MaBasa Crass smbvoidary on froal alorg wilh Flest Initial, Lant Name snd Rank 6‘ '
- o
Jclass A& B GHint insignia Siackinen Vistous Class+h & B Cubout coil msigita - $ATS00, #4206, SAZH05 « Pair Gl | ¥2HT
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g

Ciags A & B -Shirt Iasignia Biackinton Varlous Class-A & B Cut-od coliar Insipola - $A2009 & JR2809-2 - Pair Siher };_3 e
tBadge - Chinta Btackinion 81008 Wilh either 45965, ABI89, A6R73 o7 AGYT? cantet in bius enarmel - Bluz Jallering eatd {2,600
Badga - Caplars LT Blackntan 21009 With slthes ABIDT or ABSBS cantar In blue apama) - Blua letiedng Silvar {@im
Badge - FF, Eng, Rascus, Pas Blackintan Birog Wilh AJ888 canler n sRver - Blua latledrg Stvar { 5952 ,@‘
Batgs - Rellred Biackinteo 1009 With ABI27 centar {n rad enamei - Sitvar Badge with Geid Panels - Red Lefledng colgasiver | (A3 T
SFFD Potch Swa altchad lmaga {s &:S”
SFFD Ratited Patch San aliched Imaga 1y

SFFD EATT. Fatch Saa atiched [mags .25 |
SFED EMT-) Patoh Sue atiched lmaga Y %__
SFFD EMT- B Patch Ses stiched Imaga 1.

]

Class-A Pant Flachhalmer-Fiing Crass 30846 100°% Poly NawBus | 4] G5
G125 80C Fanl Firowar PADE 7805 9,50z 5% FFRI5% Colton Bend NawSle 1 9S4GE5
ClassF0C Pamt Firawear PARS-TOUG 9.50z 55% EFRMSYM Cotion Bend - 1T Shis vawybre k3L~ %)
Beols HoneyWelFroWasitraton 3003 Lasdther - 2prer bronl Black

Boats Heney'WsliProdaniogien 008 14 Inch Pukon Burkes Bood Black

Hogts Thatugoud BiI4-0446 Front Ziprar Laater « 8 nch Black 1S5, (7
Baois Theeogaod 804-007 Pulon Side Tpperk.eatier - B hich stk 1 SPES O
Baols Red Wing AT Loalher - Lata-uplripper Biatk

Rogls Red Wirg 3471 Leather « Pt On Black

Hools Darner 42982 Steiker || GTX - Skis Zgper giack 1V L0
Houts 511 12625 ATAG - Laaiba - 8 ncht Sk | ]SS0
Basts . Ghs Shadaw 14 Inch Pul-an Bunker Bop} Black

Class-a Shoe - bien ", Racky 5108 YiGlnas - Mar's Slack b
Class-A Shoe - Waman Focky 2108 HiGlogs - ‘Momen's Black  {ZC7T, 3
Clans-A Shoe - ben Batas 22141 HiGkss « Men's Black | =, &
Class-A Shoa - Women Hales 2241 HiGRo9s - Women's Black f-’%? .

2R Drtgman 1511 or 1813 Pfeins w4 Gold or Sitver tachls sz | 15,4
I 511 59405019 Opaeator Tactical Bat Slack ,

N
oo
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B8 Btackhawk e Tactical Bait Black

Class A Tia - Maris Cin-an Bark Navy =
Clags A Tia « Womens Cross-ouar alyle Dask Mawy |<f,

Tia Clip Bar Tle Clip - Plain Goisivar | 3, “755 |
N Plate Firs) Irifia) acd Last Hamo Gotdisiver | {5
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Health and Safety
&, Management of Health and Safefy

Workers will be provided with a safe and healthy work environment. Conditions in
All work and residential facilities shall be safe, clean, and consistent with all
Applicable laws and regulations regarding health and safety, The contractors and
Their subcontractors shall provide written health and safety guidelines for employees
In terms of equipment, training, management, and work pradtices in the local
Laoguage(s) of the employees.

Cut and Ron

Contractors, subcontractors inchuding point of assembly facilities ghall not shut down or
Reduce orders to a point of assembly facility in order to deny workers any right or standard
Protected by this code, or to otherwise¢ avoid complying with this dode, including their right
to freely associate.

%/{/M /%”’O 12/5,/9013

RECEIPTORACKNOWLEDGEMENT BY RIDDER " DATE

This acknowledgement is part of the bid documents and shall be icluded with bid
submittal. Non-receipt of acknowledgement by bidder in no way felieves bidder of
obligation of compliance with any terms and conditions stated in the Code of Conduct
and Code of Compliance.

T2/81T 38%d

SWEDAINM SIATN 9zep39z5es  c1:cT £182/£6/2130



STATE OF NEW MEXICO

TAXATION AND REVENUE DEPARTMENT

RESIDENT BUSINESS CERTIFICATE

Issued to: NEVE'S UNEFORMS INC.

DBA: NEVE'S UNIFORMS INC,
£120 OSAGE ST STE 200
DENVER, CO B0221-7828

Expires;  9=Jul-2015

Pursuant to Sections 13-1-21 and 13-1-22 NMSA 1978 the Person or Busingss Named Hereln has met the
statutory requirements and has besn swarded a Resident Business Certlficate.
Cartlficate Mumbar:

L1179919680 52 S gimb

Demesia Padilla, CPA, Cabinet Secratary

THIS CERTIFICATE IS NOT TOANEFERABLE
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