CITY OF SANTA FE
BID TABULATION
ITB # 23/10/B
General Construction Services
Bid Opening 11/2/22 @ 2pm

(AA)UNIT | (AB)UNIT (AC)UNIT (AD)UNIT AE)UNIT (AF)UNIT (AG)UNIT (AH)UNIT
Item # ITEM QTY UNIT PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - PRICE - ESA PRICE - PRICE - First PRICE -
B&D EMCO RMCI Steamatic |[— | Anchor Built Mesa Jaypen

Wage Rates for Projects Under $60,000.00
1 1 Hourly

Superintendent — Regular Hourly Rate $105.00 $58.00 $164.00 $75.00 $170.00 $60.00 $98.13 $80.00
2 1 Hourly

Superintendent — Overtime Hourly Rate $155.00 $90.00 $224.00 $110.00 $180.00 $60.00 $147.20 $100.00
3 Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Regular Hourly 1 Hourly

Rate $95.00 $49.75 $152.00 $75.00 $135.00 $50.00 $88.04 $70.00
4 Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Overtime 1 Hourly

Hourly Rate $142.50 $75.00 $207.00 $110.00 $145.00 $75.00 $132.06 $80.00
5 1 Hourly

Laborer — Regular Hourly Rate $75.00 $31.00 $58.00 $66.50 $92.00 $40.00 $61.52 $50.00
6 1 Hourly

Laborer — Overtime Hourly Rate $112.50 $46.50 $86.00 $99.86 $102.00 $60.00 $92.28 $60.00

Wage Rates for Projects Over $60,000.00
7 1 Hourly

Superintendent — Regular Hourly Rate $110.00 $59.00 $164.00 $75.00 $170.00 $60.00 $97.13 $80.00
8 1 Hourly

Superintendent — Overtime Hourly Rate $165.00 $91.00 $224.00 $110.00 $180.00 $60.00 $145.40 $100.00
9 Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Regular Hourly 1 Hourly

Rate $100.00 $57.00 $152.00 $75.00 $135.00 $53.00 $87.04 $70.00
10 Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Overtime 1 Hourl

Hourly Rate oY |$150.00 $85.50 $207.00 $110.00 $145.00 $79.50 $130.56 $80.00
11 1 Hourly

Laborer — Regular Hourly Rate $80.00 $44.00 $58.00 $66.50 $92.00 $42.00 $60.52 $50.00
12 Laborer — Overtime Hourly Rate 1 Hourly [$120.00 $66.00 $86.00 $99.86 $102.00 $63.00 $90.78 $60.00

Other Rates
13 Discount off all materials. Enter zero if no discount is 1 o

offered ° 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% No Bid 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% No Bid
14 Temporary Site office trailer, rental rate 1 Daily No Bid|$25.00 $90.00 $450/month $50.00 $6.50 $50.00 $95.00
15 1 Daily $6.90/LF Based

Temporary fencing, rental rate No Bid|$20.00 $71.00 $2.79/LF $50.00 $10.00 on 400 LF $25.00
16 Sanitary/toilet facilities, rental rate 1 Daily No Bid|$10.00 $15.00 $210.00 $5.00 $6.50 $5.50 $20.00
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Witness: Signature/Name: D - ‘JW Date/Time: 1 1 /7/22 @ 7 : 1 5a

Witness: Signature/Name: SW SMZ Date/Time: 1 1 /8/2022
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