CITY OF SANTA FE
BID TABULATION
ITB # 23/13/B

Miscellaneous Plumbing Services

Bid Opening 11/2/22 @ 2pm

(AA)UNIT (AC)UNIT
PRICE AB)JUNIT PRICE (AD)UNIT
Item # ITEM TY UNIT ——=— | PRICE - ——
E— - Q1Y — Anchor W Anytime PRICE
Built B Plumbing
Wage Rates for Projects Under $60,000.00
1 1 Hourly
Superintendent — Regular Hourly Rate $60.00 $105.00 No Bid
2 1 Hourly
Superintendent — Overtime Hourly Rate $60.00 $155.00 No Bid
3 Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Regular Hourly 1 Hourly
Rate $75.00 $95.00 $200.00
4 Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Overtime 1 Hourly
Hourly Rate $112.50 $142.50 $300.00
5 1 Hourly
Laborer — Regular Hourly Rate $40.00 $75.00 $200.00
6 1 Hourly
Laborer — Overtime Hourly Rate $60.00 $112.50 $300.00
Hourly
Wage Rates for Projects Over $60,000.00
7 1 Hourly
Superintendent — Regular Hourly Rate $60.00 $110.00 No Bid
8 1 Hourly
Superintendent — Overtime Hourly Rate $60.00 $165.00 No Bid
9 Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Regular Hourly 1 Hourly
Rate $85.00 $100.00 No Bid
Journeyman or Experienced Worker — Overtime
10 Thourly Rate ! Houly " l¢42750  |$150.00  |No Bid
1 Laborer — Regular Hourly Rate ! Hourly $42.00 $80.00 No Bid
12 Laborer — Overtime Hourly Rate 1 Hourly |$63.00 $120.00 No Bid
Other Rates
13 Discount off all materials. Enter zero if no discount is | o
offered ° 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
14 Temporary Site office trailer, rental rate 1 Daily $6.50 No Bid No Bid
15 Temporary fencing, rental rate 1 Daily $10.00 No Bid No Bid
16 Sanitary/toilet facilities, rental rate 1 Daily $6.50 No Bid No Bid

Witness: Signature/Name:
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Witness: Signature/Name: SW Sa)bcég

Date/Time: 11/8/22 8:003

Date/Time: 1 1/8/2022




